
  
  

 

 

 

 

 

 
As COVID-19 continues to impact 
our communities, we’re 

committed to doing what’s best 
for our customers, our employees 
and the public. We take very 

seriously our responsibility to 
help care for and protect the 
communities we serve. 

 
It’s important to share some of 
the steps Hayward is taking to 

keep things running as normal as 
possible so you can continue to 
run your business. As we gain 

new facts we’re acting quickly to 
comply. 
 

To date, we are practicing social 
distancing, limiting customer 
visits, canceling trade shows, 

avoiding gatherings with 10 or 
more people and encouraging the 
use of online meeting software in 

place of team meetings.  
 
Our manufacturing and supply 

chain continues intact and we are 
not projecting any significant loss 
of productivity to date. We have 

forward staged plenty of 
inventory into our distribution 
centers. Our organization will 

continue to provide our services 
to you, virtually or directly, as 
needed. 

 
There is nothing more important 

than our collective health and 
safety. Please take care of 
yourselves, your loved ones, and 

others who may need help. 

 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

The Hayward CAT 6000 features 

an intuitive interface, innovative 

solid-state free chlorine sensor 

and the most precise sanitizer 

control available. 

 CAT 6000 guides you through 

programming. Innovative 

sensing technology utilizes a 

unique feature named “Dynamic 

Sanitizer Control”, allowing for 

more precise sanitization 

control than ever before. 

The CAT 6000 uses innovative 

solid-state sensing technology 

for its low-maintenance true 

free chlorine, temperature, and 

conductivity sensors. 

NSF/ANSI Standard 50 

Certified. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Versatile control options 

including 4-20mA 

programmable inputs, flow and 

level sensing inputs, 

programmable powered output 

and dedicated pH and sanitizer 

outputs. 

Built-in Wi-Fi connectivity 

allows access via the Poolcomm 

website.  Bluetooth capability 

allows the system to 

communicate with peripherals.  
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The Clear O3 water purifying 

system from Paramount creates 

ozone using a proprietary UV 

bulb specially designed to excite 

ozone molecules from the 

oxygen in the air.  

The ozone enriched air is mixed 

with the water going into the 

pool circulation pump. A 

proprietary -flow meter 

establishes the ideal -flow of air 

for efficient ozone production. 

The extruded aluminum main 

body has fiber-filled resin end 

caps and is engineered to 

survive in the pool equipment 

environment.  

Radiant heat ribs dissipate heat 

to maintain ozone output at 

peak operating temperatures 

and the side panel is 

removable, making 

maintenance and bulb 

replacement easy. 

Single unit works effectively on 

pools up to 55,000 gallons. 

Paramount is a Hayward 

Company. 

Hayward TigerShark® 

Robotic Cleaner 

 
Renowned for many years for 

its solidity and efficiency, the 
Hayward TigerShark® cleans the 
bottom, walls and waterline. 

 
With its ASCL microprocessor  

(Adaptive Seek Control Logic), 
it calculates the shape 
and size of your pool to 

clean every spot 
efficiently. 

 

The Hayward TigerShark® is 
fully automatic, with no need 

for an exterior bag or pipe.  
 

Available in the Quick Clean 
(QC) version for full cleaning in 
under 2 hours and 

with optional foam-brush for 
pools with tile 

finish. 
 
An optional 

caddy cart 

makes 

handling 

easier.  

Pool water testing 

made easy with your 

smartphone. 

Launching in 

April, the easy 

to use app 

allows quick 

and accurate 

measurements 

and provides 

historical 

results of 5 

important 

water quality 

parameters: pH, Chlorine, 

Total Alkalinity, Total Hardness 

and Cyanuric Acid. 

The app will recommend 

chemical dosages for 

perfect 

water 

balance 

based on 

pool size. 

Dip the strip in the water 

and align in app window for 

fast accurate results every time. 

The test strips are assembled  

in a convenient 

specially 

designed point 

of sale display 

carton of 12 

bottles with 

50 strips per 

bottle. 

Contact your 

local Hayward distributor to get 

a free trial size bottle.  
Caddy Cart 
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